
REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India
EXTRAORDINARY

PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 178] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MARCH 28,2000/CHAITRA 8,1922

MINISTRY OF LAW, JUSTICE & COMPANY
AFFAIRS

(Department of Legal Affairs)

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 28th March, 2000

G.S.R. 262(E).—In exercise of the powers
conferred by Section 15 of the Notaries Act, 1952 (53 of
1952), the Central Government hereby makes the
following Rules further to amend the Notaries Rules, 1956,
namely:—

1. These Rules may be called the Notaries (Second
Amendment) Rules, 2000.

2. In the Notaries Rules, 1956,—

(a) in rule 8, in sub-rule (4), for the words "three
years", the words "five years" shall be substituted;

(b) in rule 8 A, for the words "three years", the words
"five years" shall be substituted.

[F. No. 5 (15)/94-NC]

KRISHNA KUMAR, Jt. Secy.& Legal Adviser

Note:-The Principal Rules, were not i f ied vide S.R.O.324,
dated 14-2-1956 and subsequently amended by GSR 870
(E) dated 8-7-1997 and G.S.R. 17 (E) dated 5th January,
2000.

875 GI/2000

Printed by the Manager, Govt of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.




